

**RFP for Processing USDA Food Items**  
Lowndes County Schools

A	B	C	D	E	F	G	H	I
Item#	Product	Specification	Gold Kreek	Gold Kist	Tyson		Items selected are highlighted in yellow	
		<b>Chicken</b>						
1	WG,WM, FC Chicken Breast Tenderloins	CN labeled or Sign/date to Certify,(3) 1.5 oz. Breaded FC chicken tenders, each serving provides 2 oz. eq. M/MA and 1 oz. eq. grain, <b>USDA Food Code: 100103</b>	Gold Kreek Item# 792441 \$49.76/\$0.440 8/4# bags, 32# Sodium 460 mg.	Gold Kist Item #7572 \$49.05/\$.45 6/5# bags, 30# Sodium 450 mg.	Tyson Item #703322-0928 \$68.18/\$0.6198 110/4.5 oz., 30.9 lbs. Sodium 470 mg.			
2	WG,WM, FC Spicy Chicken Breast Filet	CN labeled or Sign/date to Certify,(1) 4 oz. Breaded FC chicken filet provides 2 oz. eq. M/MA and 1 oz. eq. grain, <b>USDA Food Code: 100103</b>	Gold Kreek Item #792431 \$68.00/\$0.531 8/4# bags, 32# Sodium 380 mg.	Gold Kist Item #7517 \$67.65/\$0.56 6/5# bags, 30# Sodium 570 mg.	Wrong item bid on			
3	WG, FC, breaded dark meat large popcorn chicken	CN labeled or Sign/date to Certify, (10) .45 oz. breaded FC chicken nuggets provides 2 oz. eq. M/MA and 1 oz. eq. grain <b>USDA Food Code: 100103</b>	Gold Kreek Item #791893 \$44.38/\$0.376 8/4# bags, 32# Sodium 570 mg.	Gold Kist Item #110458 \$41.25/\$0.38 6/5# bags, 30# Sodium 570 mg.	Tyson Item # 026976-0928 \$71.68/\$0.6400 112/4.3 oz., 30.26 lbs. Sodium 490 mg.			
4	WG, FC,WM, spicy chicken breast chunks	CN labeled or Sign/date to Certify, (4) 1 oz. breaded FC chicken nuggets provide 2 oz. eq. M/MA and 1 oz. eq. grain, <b>USDA Food Code: 100103</b>	Gold Kreek Item#792402 \$67.20/\$0.525 8/4# bags, 32# Sodium 380 mg.	No Bid	Tyson Item # 070374-0928 \$41.34/\$0.2756 150/3.45 oz., 32.81 lbs. Sodium 390 mg.			
5	WG,FC, WM, Chicken Breast filet	CN labeled or Sign/date to certify, (1) 4 oz, breaded, FC, chicken filet provides 2 oz. eq. M/MA and 1 oz. eq. grain, <b>USDA Food Code: 100103</b>	Gold Kreek Item #792421 \$56.48/\$0.441 8/4# bags, 32# Sodium 470 mg.	Gold Kist Item # 7516 \$67.65/\$0.528 6/5# bags, 30# Sodium 610 mg.	Tyson Item # 070302-0928 \$58.79, \$0.4454, 132/3.75 oz. 30.94 lbs. Sodium 290 mg.			

**RFP for Processing USDA Food Items**  
Lowndes County Schools

A	B	C	D	E	F	G	H	I
Item#	Product	Specification	Gold Kreek	Gold Kist	Tyson		Items selected are highlighted in yellow	
6	WG,FC, WM, Chicken Breast Chunks	CN labeled or Sign/Date to certify, (4) 1 oz. Breaded, FC, chicken nuggets provides 2 oz. eq. M/MA and 1 oz. eq. grain, <b>USDA Food Code: 100103</b>	Gold Kreek Item # 792401 \$58.40/\$0.456 8/4# bags, 32# Sodium 470 mg.	Gold Kist Item # 7518 \$67.65/\$0.528 6/5# bags, 30# Sodium 570 mg.	Tyson Item # 070362-0928, \$57.00/\$0.4711, 121/3.95 oz., 30 lbs., Sodium 330 mg.			
7	FC,WG, Breaded Drumsticks and Thighs	CN labeled or Sign/Date to certify, (1) thigh appx. 5.08 oz. (1) thigh provides 2 oz. eq M/MA and 1 oz. grain, (1) drumstick provides 2 oz. eq. M/MA and 1 oz. grain, <b>USDA Food Code: 100103</b>	Gold Kreek Item #791880 \$55.52/ \$0.496 8/4# bags, 32# Sodium 490 mg.	No Bid	Tyson Item# 666000-928 \$53.35/\$0.6506 82/4.7-8.4 oz, 29.64 lbs., Sodium 470 mg.			
8	Dark meat pancake dippers	CN labeled or Sign/Date to certify, (12) .45 oz. provides 2 oz. eq M/MA and 1 oz. eq grain, <b>USDA Food Code: 100103</b>	Gold Kreek Item #791861 \$43.52/\$0.3486 8/4# bags, 32# Sodium 500 mg.	No Bid	Tyson Item # 024841-0928 \$68.21/\$0.4372 156/3.12 oz. , 30.45 lbs. Sodium 320 mg.			
9	Unbreaded dark meat chicken strips	CN labeled or Sign/Date to certify, 2.14 oz. provides 2 oz. eq M/MA, <b>USDA Food Code: 100103</b>	Gold Kreek Item #791896 \$55.84/\$0.234 8/4# bags, 32# Sodium 500 mg.	Gold Kist Item # 1260 \$48.75/\$0.25 6/5# bags/ 30# Sodium 490 mg.	Tyson Item #004621-0928 \$49.20 \$0.3075 160/3 oz. 30 lbs. Sodium 400 mg.			
10	WG, WM Brkft. Breast Fillet	CN labeled or Sign/Date to certify. (1) 2 oz. serving provides 1 oz. eq M/MA and .50 oz. eq grain. <b>USDA Food Code: 100103</b>	Gold Kreek Item #792426 \$57.12/\$0.223 8/4# bags, 32# Sodium 230 mg.	Gold Kist Item #7519 \$49.05/\$0.225 6/5# bags, 30# Sodium 240 mg.	Tyson Item #070303-0928 \$57.00, \$0.2522, 226/2.12 oz., 30 lbs. Sodium 250 mg.			

**RFP for Processing USDA Food Items**  
Lowndes County Schools

Item#	Product	Specification	Gold Kreek	Gold Kist	Tyson	Items selected are highlighted in yellow
11	WG Breaded Large Popcorn	CN labeled or Sign/Date to certify. 1(10) 0.435 oz. serving provides 2 oz. eq M/MA and 1 oz. eq grain. <b>USDA Food Code: 100103</b>	Gold Kreek Item #791493 \$44.38/\$0.376 8/4# bags, 32# Sodium 600 mg.	Gold Kist Item #110452 \$41.25/\$0.38194 6/5# bags, 30# Sodium 550 mg.	Tyson Item # 026976-0928 \$71.68, \$0.6400, 112/4.3 oz. 30.26 lbs.	
12	FC Whole Grain Breaded 8 piece parts	CN labeled or Sign/Date to certify. (1) breast or thigh or 1 drum, 1 wing combo provides 2 oz. eq. M/MA and 1.5 oz. eq grain servings. <b>USDA Food Code: 100100</b>	No Bid	Gold Kist Item # 7812, \$53.37/\$0.72122, 6/5# bags, 30# Sodium 570 mg.	No Bid	

**RFP for Processing USDA Food Items**  
Lowndes County Schools

A	B	C	D	E	F	G	H	I	J	K	L	M	N	O	P	Q
Item#	Product	Specification	Manuf Code	Manf Name	Brand	Pack size	Case Wt	CN serv Size	CN serv per case	DF lbs per Cs	USDA value per case	USDA value per serv	FFS cost per case	FFS cost per serv	Total Case \$ (L+N)	Total Serv \$ (M+O)
		<b>Chicken</b>														
1	WG,WM, FC Chicken Breast Tenderloins	CN labeled or Sign/date to Certify,(3) 1.5 oz. Breaded FC chicken tenders, each serving provides 2 oz. eq. M/MA and 1 oz. eq. grain, <b>USDA Food Code: 100103</b>													\$ -	\$ -
2	WG,WM, FC Spicy Chicken Breast Filet	CN labeled or Sign/date to Certify,(1) 4 oz. Breaded FC chicken filet provides 2 oz. eq. M/MA and 1 oz. eq. grain, <b>USDA Food Code: 100103</b>													\$ -	\$ -
3	WG, FC, breaded dark meat large popcorn chicken	CN labeled or Sign/date to Certify, (10) .45 oz. breaded FC chicken nuggets provides 2 oz. eq. M/MA and 1 oz. eq. grain <b>USDA Food Code: 100103</b>													\$ -	\$ -
4	WG, FC,WM, spicy chicken breast chunks	CN labeled or Sign/date to Certify, (4) 1 oz. breaded FC chicken nuggets provide 2 oz. eq. M/MA and 1 oz. eq. grain, <b>USDA Food Code: 100103</b>													\$ -	\$ -
5	WG,FC, WM, Chicken Breast filet	CN labeled or Sign/date to certify, (1) 4 oz, breaded, FC, chicken filet provides 2 oz. eq. M/MA and 1 oz. eq. grain, <b>USDA Food Code: 100103</b>													\$ -	\$ -

**RFP for Processing USDA Food Items**  
Lowndes County Schools

A	B	C	D	E	F	G	H	I	J	K	L	M	N	O	P	Q
Item#	Product	Specification	Manuf Code	Manf Name	Brand	Pack size	Case Wt	CN serv Size	CN serv per case	DF lbs per Cs	USDA value per case	USDA value per serv	FFS cost per case	FFS cost per serv	Total Case \$ (L+N)	Total Serv \$ (M+O)
6	WG,FC, WM, Chicken Breast Chunks	CN labeled or Sign/Date to certify, (4) 1 oz. Breaded, FC, chicken nuggets provides 2 oz. eq. M/MA and 1 oz. eq. grain, <b>USDA Food Code: 100103</b>													\$ -	\$ -
7	FC,WG, Breaded Drumsticks and Thighs	CN labeled or Sign/Date to certify, (1) thigh appx. 5.08 oz. (1) thigh provides 2 oz. eq M/MA and 1 oz. grain, (1) drumstick provides 2 oz. eq. M/MA and 1 oz. grain, <b>USDA Food Code: 100103</b>													\$ -	\$ -
8	Dark meat pancake dippers	CN labeled or Sign/Date to certify, (12) .45 oz. provides 2 oz. eq M/MA and 1 oz. eq grain, <b>USDA Food Code: 100103</b>													\$ -	\$ -
9	Unbreaded dark meat chicken strips	CN labeled or Sign/Date to certify, 2.14 oz. provides 2 oz. eq M/MA, <b>USDA Food Code: 100103</b>													\$ -	\$ -
10	WG, WM Brkft. Breast Fillet	CN labeled or Sign/Date to certify. (1) 2 oz. serving provides 1 oz. eq M/MA and .50 oz. eq grain. <b>USDA Food Code: 100103</b>														

**RFP for Processing USDA Food Items**  
Lowndes County Schools

\_\_\_\_\_  
Vendor Name

A	B	C	D	E	F	G	H	I	J	K	L	M	N	O	P	Q
Item#	Product	Specification	Manuf Code	Manf Name	Brand	Pack size	Case Wt	CN serv Size	CN serv per case	DF lbs per Cs	USDA value per case	USDA value per serv	FFS cost per case	FFS cost per serv	Total Case \$ (L+N)	Total Serv \$ (M+O)
11	WG Breaded Large Popcorn	CN labeled or Sign/Date to certify. 1(10) 0.435 oz. serving provides 2 oz. eq M/MA and 1 oz. eq grain. <b>USDA Food Code: 100103</b>														



Lowndes County School Nutrition  
**ATTACHMENT G: EVALUATION SCORESHEET**  
 for Processing USDA Foods Proposal #2020-01

Company Name:

Evaluator(s):

Date:

Points			
Value	Score	Item	Details
√		Sealed Submission-Form & Deadline	
√		Written Response to RFP	
√		Product Samples Provided if requested	
√		Discussions/Negotiations-Only Allowed with RFP Administrator	
√		Signed Nutritional analysis for each specification completed in chart	
√		Clear Preparation & Cooking Instructions	
√		HACCP Verification	
√		A: Signed Proposal & Debarment Certification	
√		B: Food Specifications Chart	
√		C: Signed Lobbying Certificate & Disclosure	
		<b>SCOPE OF WORK</b>	
25		Highly acceptable nutrition analyses	
25		High student/adult Taste Test Scores	
20		Acceptable Processing Cost	
20		Low minimum shipment required to warehouse	
10		Ship to System Warehouse or GaDOE Warehouse	
100		<b>TOTALS</b>	